BID TABULATION FORM
PRINTING OF ARTWORK FOR POCKET PLAZA - RFB #PUR0620-211
JULY 1, 2020 AT 3:00 PM

Rapids Reproductions Cedar Graphics Copyworks Firespring
Cedar Rapids, IA Hiawatha, 1A Cedar Rapids, IA Lincoln, NE
Description Qty| Unit Price Extgnded Unit Price Extgnded Unit Price Exte_nded Unit Price Exte_nded
Price Price Price Price

BASE BID
Printing and delivery of 8' x 15' vinyl wall panels 4 $288.40 $1,153.60 $406.75 $1,627.00 $311.83 $1,247.32 $740.23] $2,960.90
Printing and delivery of 3' x 4'9" fence panels 5 $140.00 $700.00 $183.00 $915.00 $330.33 $1,651.65 $561.88| $2,809.38
Printing and delivery of 9" x 12" information plaque 1 $10.00 $10.00 $205.00 $205.00 $149.02 $149.02 $275.50 $275.50
Total amount for base bid: $1,863.60 $2,747.00 $3,047.99 $6,045.78
OPTIONAL ITEMS
Purchase/delivery of brackets for 8' x 15' wall panels 4 no bid $75.00 $300.00 no bid no bid
Purchase/delivery of black metal frame for 9"x12" plaque 1 $30.00 $30.00 $55.00 $55.00 no bid no bid
Certified Local Business? yes yes yes no
Warranty information? not stated not stated not stated not stated
Pricing firm for 12 months? yes yes no, 3 months not stated
Lead time: 7-10 calendar days 14-17 calendar days 21 calendar days not stated

Sighature Page

Comments/Exceptions: none none see hid did not use bid forms
Addenda acknowledged: yes yes yes no

Accept Pcard? Yes not stated yes not stated
Quick Pay Discount: none none none none
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